



LEGAL SERVICES
BOARD

Legal Services Board
The Rookery
2 Dyott Street
London WC1A 1DE

www.legalservicesboard.org.uk

06 August 2021

FoI request (Ref: 20210725-01)

Thank you for your request for information about a planned thematic risk review into the independence of in-house solicitors by the Solicitors Regulation Authority (SRA).

The LSB does not hold the information that you have requested, please find this set out below.

- a) what plans the SRA has to carry out a review since it acknowledges it has such plans
we have searched our records and do not hold the information requested
- b) what oversight you've had over those plans
See above
- c) why you are happy with their delay?
See above.

If you are dissatisfied with this response to your request for information, you have the right to ask for an internal review / to submit a complaint (see [LSB's Freedom of information – Complaints procedure](#)).

If you are dissatisfied with the outcome of your complaint, you may refer the matter to the Information Commissioner for a decision. Please be aware that the Commissioner will be unlikely to make a decision until you have been through our internal complaints procedure first. You can write to the Commissioner at:

FOI/EIR Complaints Resolution
Information Commissioner's Office
Wycliffe House
Water Lane
Wilmslow
Cheshire
SK9 5AF

The reference for your request, which should be quoted in all correspondence, is: 20210725-01.